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: Bank Guarantee No. 6361924 8650800214,
l Amount of GuaranleJﬂ. 9‘ 2 i 90 il onn l i
} Date of Issue 9-5' Nonozq ...............
! Valid Upto ... 21 Ay st 20267

" PERFORMANCE BANK GUARANTEE (UNCONDITIONAL)

To

The Exuculva Engineer,
RWD Works Division, Tikari

WHEREAS M/s M' G. Construction & Co., Court Area, Jehanabad Dist. — Jehanabad [name and
iddress of contrag@or] (hereinafter called “the contractor” ) has Undertaken, in pursuance fcr bid dated 02
rebruary 2022 to execute MR-N/21-22 Tekari/02 [name of contracl and brief deseription of Works])

Jereinafter called™ the Contract )
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AND WHEREAS it has been stipulated by you in the said conlract that the contractor shall
furnish you with a Bank Guaranlee by a scheduled bank for the sum specified therein as security

for Compliance with his obligations in accoerdance with the Contracit.

AND WHEREAS we have agreed 10 give the Contractor such a Bank Guarantee,

NOW THEREFORE we here by affirm that we are the Guarantor and responsible to you, 0N

peha!f of the contractor, upto a 1otal of Rs 22,20,000 [amount of Guarantee ], Twenly Two Lakh

and Twenty Thousand Rupees [amount in words), such sum being payable in the types and
proportions of currencies in which the contracl Price Is payable, and we undertake to pay you.
upon your first written demand and without cavil or argument, any sum of sums within the limits
of Rs 22,20,000 [amount of Guaranlee] as aforesaid without you needing to prove or 10 show

the sum specified therein.

grounds or reasons for your demand for
the said debt from the contractor before

We hereby wawve the necessity of your demanding

presenting us wilh the demand

ge or addition to or other modification of the terms of the Contract or

der of any of the Contracl documents which

y way release us from any liability under

We further agree thal no chan
of the contract of the Works lo be performed there un

may be made between you and the Contraclor shall in an
y such change, addition or modification.

date of expiry of defect Liability period.

th.s guarantee, and we hereby waive notice of an

This guaranlee shall be valid until 28 days from the

Signalure and Seal of the Guarantor.

ﬂ .
6o
Name of Bank: QY ate  Comk 65- Todia

Address: gME Amm?ﬂl’)f-dr 61"\'1(-&1 (’l"ﬂﬂdle, E‘lmﬂﬂ- Alf’lf/‘:}[ﬂ;c‘!"

Date: '25'/”_} 2024 ] -
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11/26/24, 4:18 PM Gmail - 2294 BG Verification pdf

§ EXECUTIVE ENGINEER RWD TIKARI <eerwdtikari@gmail.com>

(mall

2294 BG Verification.pdf

72 messages

EXECUTIVE ENGINEER RWD TIKARI <eerwdtikari@gmail.com> Tue, Nov 26, 2024 at 4.04 PM

To: sbi.63699@sbi.co.in

Please verify

- 2294 BG Verification.pdf
847K

SBI SME AURANGABAD(63699) <sbi.63699@sbi.co.in> Tue, Nov 26, 2024 at 4:13 PM

To: EXECUTIVE ENGINEER RWD TIKARI <eerwdtikari@gmail.com>

Dear Sir,

With reference to the trail mail, we herby confirm the issuance of the Bank Guarantee attached in the trail

mail.

Regards
Chief Manager
SBI SME Aurangabad

From: EXECUTIVE ENGINEER RWD TIKARI <eerwdtikari@gmail.com>,

Sent: 26 November 2024 4:04 PM
To: SBI SME AURANGABAD(63699) <sbi.63699@sbi.co.in>

Subject: 2294 BG Verification.pdf

Warning: This email is not originated from SBI. Do not click on attachment or links/URL unless sender is reliable. Malware/
Viruses can be easily transmitted via email.

Please verify

The information in this mail is confidential and is intended solely for addressee. Access to this mail by anyone else is
unauthorized. Copying or further distribution beyond the original recipient may be unlawful. Any opinion expressed in this

mail is that of sender and does not necessarily reflect that of State Bank group.

https:l/maiI.google.comimailful(]l?ik=b3071 b1483&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a:r34620095711326022028&simpl=msg-a:r26883031388... 1/1
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SI.LNo.| Account No. of FD

Date of Issue Amount

1 72043100045399 15.11.2024 1,50,000.00
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2225 FD Verification nbox e

G EXECUTIVE ENGINEER RWD TIK... = 211

EXECUTIVE ENGINEER RWD TIK... = 221

—————————— Forwarded message ---------
From: EXECUTIVE ENGINEER RWD TIKARI

BO7204 4 days ago @
€

We confirm the above said FDR, amt of Rs.
1,50,000/- ( Rs. One Lakh Fifty thousand only)
has been pledged in fav of " EE, RWD WORKS

DIVISION, TIKARI".

Chief Manager,
Jehanabad

—




